
 

 

Confessions   
Sundays at 7:30am and 10:30am   

Weekdays before Mass.   

 

 

 

Tuesdays    
7:00 PM Our Mother of Perpetual Help 
Devotions followed by Benediction.  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

July 27 
 

Counters: Mary Kay Waldhaus & Steve Blickhan 
 

Coffee & Donuts:  Rich & Donna Lane 
 

 

 

August 3 
 

Counters: Rich Lane & Phil Kemner 
 

Coffee & Donuts:  John Quinn 

ST ROSE OF LIMA PARISH  
A Personal Parish of the Catholic Diocese of Springfield for the Celebration of the Roman Rite in Latin  
according to the Liturgical Books of 1962, under the Pastoral Care of the Priestly Fraternity of St. Peter 

 
 
 
 

Rev. Karl Pikus, FSSP         
Rev. Arnaud Devillers, FSSP, Priest in Residence  

1009 North 8th Street, Quincy, Illinois 62301    Phone: (217) 222-2511    

Parish Office Email: st-rose-quincy@att.net / Fr. Pikus Email: kpikus@dio.org  

Website: www.saintrosequincy.org 

Diocesan Child Abuse Reporting and Investigation Number (217) 321-1155 
 

Seventh Sunday after Pentecost 

July 27, 2025 

 

Mass Schedule & Intentions July 27 - August 3 
 Sunday Seventh Sunday after Pentecost 
 8:00am Kelly Zanger 
 11:00am Pro Populo (for parishioners) 
 

 Monday         Ss. Nazarius & Celsus, Martyrs, Victor I, Pope   
                        & Martyr, and St. Innocent I, Pope & Confessor 

 12:10pm Special Intention  
 

 Tuesday St. Martha, Virgin, Comm. Ss. Felix,        
  Simplicius, Faustinus, & Beatrice 

 12:10pm Alexander Guegel 
 

 Wednesday Feria, Comm. Ss. Abdon & Sennen 
 12:10pm Special Intention  
 

 Thursday St. Ignatius, Confessor 
 12:10pm Andrea McCann 
 

 Friday Feria, Holy Machabees, St. Peter in Chains 
 12:10pm Gary Damon † 
 

 Saturday St. Alphonsus Mary of Liguori,               
  Comm. St. Stephen I 
 12:10pm Cindy Fessler 
 

 Sunday Eighth Sunday after Pentecost 
 8:00am Mary Kay Waldhaus 
 11:00am Pro Populo (for parishioners) 



             

Next Sunday, August 3 
 

Second Collection for the St. John Vianney 
Seminarian Fund  

 

 
 

Mass Intentions 
  

We have openings for Mass intentions 
beginning in August.  Mass stipends are $10.  
Contact the parish office to schedule. 

 

 

 

 

Local Events 
 

Bake for Birthright 

Birthright is asking each parish to donate 
homemade or bought baked good items for 
their booth at the KC BBQ.  St. Rose’s day to 
bring baked goods is Friday, August 8.  These 
can be brought to the KC grounds on August 
8.  In conjunction with the Bake Sale, 
Birthright will hold a raffle for a handmade 
quilt and a “Dining Out” package. Each person 
who donates to the bake sale will have their 
name entered into this raffle with our grateful 
thanks for your generosity. If you bring your 
baked item to the K of C grounds, you can fill 
out your raffle ticket then. Contact Patty at 
217-577-8558 with questions.   
  

You may also drop off your baked goods at 
Zanger & Associates Realtors at 12th & 
Broadway but it must be before 2:00pm on 
August 8. 
  

Proceeds support the ministry of Birthright.  
Birthright has been serving our community for 
over 49 years.  It runs strictly on donations and 
are staffed 100% by volunteers. In a non-
judgmental atmosphere, Birthright assists 
young girls and women who are struggling 
with unexpected or unwanted pregnancies to 
see their babies through to birth and beyond. 

 

Attention All Women of the Quincy 

Deanery Parishes  

Quincy Deanery Council of Catholic Women’s 
Summer Gathering will be held Wednesday 
August 13 at Holy Family Parish in Mt. 
Sterling. 
 

Theme: “Woman as daughter, sister, bride and 
Mother” 
 

Featured speaker: Sr. M. Clementia Toalson, 
FSGM, Springfield Diocese Catholic 
Education, Evangelization and Faith 
Formation 
 

Registration 7:45-8:30 Cost $10  
 

Mass 8:30 with Adoration before and the 
rosary. 
 

10:00am breakfast, meeting and Lunch. Ends 
approximately 2:00pm 
 

Questions, contact Claudia Coggeshall 
QDCCW President rccogg@adams.net 217-
653-6716 

 
 
 
 
Employment Opportunity 
 

The QCES Foundation is Hiring The Quincy 
Catholic Elementary Schools Foundation is 
seeking an Executive Director. This flexible, 
full or part-time role leads fundraising, donor 
relations, and community engagement efforts 
to support Catholic education in Quincy. 
Responsibilities include overseeing the tuition 
assistance and teacher grant programs, 
managing all aspects of fundraising, 
supporting marketing initiatives, and 
partnering with the Board on strategic 
planning and goals. More details and how to 
apply can be found at www.bit.ly/QCESED.  

 

 

 

Project Rachel Help for women and men 
to heal from the pain of abortion. For 
assistance call 1-877-RACHEL-5.  

mailto:rccogg@adams.net

